meyer

ENGINEERS + ARCHITECTS

August 14, 2024

Mr. David deGeneres

Director of Wastewater

St. Charles Parish

Public Works and Wastewater

100 River Oaks Drive

Destrehan, LA 70047

EMAIL: ddegeneres@stcharlesgov.net

Re: Destrehan Wastewater Treatment Plant Aeration Basin Rehabilitation
A/E Project No. 20-2198

Dear Mr. deGeneres,

We received the bids on the above-referenced project. The apparent low bidder is
NCMC, LLC in the amount of $3,952,000. Enclosed is a copy of the bid tabulation and bid
comparison.

The Engineer’s estimate for this project was $3,993,000, therefore we recommend
awarding the Contract to NCMC, LLC in the amount of $3,952,000. However, Meyer
Engineers, Ltd. is not certified to perform a legal review of these bids and can only provide a
recommendation on the bid documents, therefore it is contingent upon your legal team’s
opinion and approval.

Sincerely,
gineers, Ltd.

, P.E., President
AS/bgc

Enclosures

MEYER ENGINEERS, LTD., A THOMPSON HOLDINGS COMPANY
4937 Hearst Street, Suite 1B | Metairie, LA 70001
504.885.9892 (office) | WWW.MEYER-E-L.COM



202198TAB

BID TABULATION

DESTREHAN WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT AERATION BASIN REHABILITATION

PROJECT NO. S211202
A/E PROJECT NO. 20-2198

MEYER ENGINEERS, LTD.
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2024

meyer

thompson

BIDDER

LICENSE
NUMBER

BASE BID

ADDENDUM

ADDENDUM

2

1

SURETY

CORPORATE
RESOLUTION

GOTTFRIED CONSTRUCTION
6 MEYERS DRIVE
COVINGTON, LA 70435

41751

NO BID

RNGD INFRASTRUCTURE, LLC
1730 TCHOUPITOULAS STREET
NEW ORLEANS, LA 70130

44187

NO BID

COMMAND CONSTRUCTION, LLC
68445 JAMES STREET
MANDEVILLE, LA 70471

40038

NO BID

M.R. PITTMAN GROUP, LLC
171-310 SERVICE ROAD
ST. ROSE, LA 70087

42296

NO BID

NCMC, LLC
14545 BARRINGER COURT
BATON ROUGE, LA 70809

08999

$3,952,000.00

PINTAIL CONTRACTING SERVICES, LLC
13559 RIVER ROAD
LULING, LA 70070

50020

$4,251,417.00

CYCLE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, LLC
6 EAST THIRD STREET
KENNER, LA 70062

36961

NO BID

INDUSTRIAL & MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS, INC.
P.0.BOX 10008
JEFFERSON, LA 70181

26581

NO BID




202198BC

BID COMPARISON

DESTREHAN WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT AERATION BASIN REHABILITION

PROJECT NO. S211202

A/E PROJECT NO. 20-2198 AUGUST 13, 2024
BID DATE: AUGUST 13, 2024

MEYER ENGINEERS, LTD.

NCMC, LLC

PINTAIL CONTRACTING SERVICES, LLC

DESCRIPTION: |v BASE BID MOBILIZATION / DEMOBILIZATION
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF MEASURE: UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price)
1 1 LS $363,000.00 $363,000.00 $370,000.00 $370,000.00 $241,417.00 $241,417.00
DESCRIPTION: [v BASE BID RELOCATION OF INFRASTRUCTURE ITEMS
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF MEASURE: UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price)
2 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
DESCRIPTION: |v BASE BID REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT OF AERATION SYSTEM, BLOWERS, AND MIXERS
UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF MEASURE: UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price) UNIT PRICE (Quantity times Unit Price)
3 1 LS $3,620,000.00 $3,620,000.00 $3,572,000.00 $3,572,000.00 $4,000,000.00 $4,000,000.00

TOTAL

$3,993,000.00

$3,952,000.00

$4,251,417.00




